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PUBLIC NOTICE

 
   Ministry of Health & Family Welfare is launching the Health Abhiyaan -
"Swasth Nari, Sashakt Parivar Abhiyaan" from 17th September, 2025,
culminating on Gandhi Jayanti.  The Abhiyaan will be undertaken in close
convergence with "Poshan Maah" being observed by Ministry of Women and
Child Development and will be inaugurated by the Hon'ble PM at Indore,
Madhya Pradesh.
 
2.  As a part of this Abhiyaan, health camps will be organized across the
nation where various health services including specialist services will be
provided to women.  These will be organized in States and Union Territories
at Ayushman Arogya Mandirs (AAMs), Community Health Centres (CHCs),
and other healthcare facilities across the country. Key activities to be
organised during the fortnight are mentioned in the attached D.O. letter dated
09th September, 2025 from Additional Secretary, Ministry of Health and
Family Welfare, GoI.
 
3.  The success of this Jan Abhiyaan depends on participation of all and in
this context, the medical colleges in the country are required to organize
health camps for  women in their medical colleges / attached hospitals and /
or assisting the Health Camps by States / UTs in the vicinity of their medical
colleges.  A portal will be available for capturing the efforts of respective
medical college.
 
4.  This Abhiyaan presents a unique opportunity to strengthen women's
health & nutrition and to empower families & communities.  All Medical
Colleges (Government / Private) / Medical Institutions are hereby requested to
actively participate in the Abhiyaan and also designate Nodal Officers for their
Medical Colleges to coordinate with Ministry of Health and Family Welfare.
The details & email ids of Nodal Officers so designated may please be shared
in the Google Form (link provided below) latest by 11th September, 2025.
https://forms.gle/HZhkKT15Dtab8SuK7
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Encl: as above

(Dr. Raghav Langer)
Secretary, NMC

 
Principals / Deans / Heads of all Medical Colleges / Institutions.
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